



Gray State LLC
David Crowley
9910 Drew Avenue South, #104
Bloomington, MN 55431

Invoice Date: July 31, 2014
Invoice Number: 171088
Responsible Atty: APG
Matter Number: 41782
Matter Description: Gray State LLC - General Representation

INVOICE

Previous Statement Balance		\$	0.00
Payments and Credits Since Last Statement		\$	0.00
Current Billing Activity			
Legal Services Rendered		\$	3,790.00
Disbursements and Other Costs Incurred		\$	0.00
Total Current Billing		\$	3,790.00
Balance Due		\$	3,790.00

Payment due upon receipt.

Please return this entire page with your payment.

Payment Type: () Check/Money Order
() Credit Card

Amount enclosed \$ _____

Remit to: Lommen Abdo, P.A.
2000 IDS Center
80 South Eighth Street
Minneapolis, Minnesota 55402
(612)339-8131
41-1381579

		Credit Card Authorization
Credit Card Number: _____		
Expiration Date: ____/____/____		
Amount: \$ _____		
Card Holder Name: _____		
Card Holder Address: _____		
Card Holder Signature: _____		

INVOICE DETAIL



Gray State LLC
David Crowley
Invoice Number: 171088
Invoice Date: July 31, 2014
Matter Number: 41782
Matter Description: Gray State LLC - General Representation

Legal Services Rendered:

DATE:	PROF:	DESC:	HOURS:	AMOUNT:
7/9/2014	APG	REVIEW AND ANALYZE MEG OPTION AGREEMENT TO PLAN AND PREPARE REVISED FOR CALL WITH D. CROWLEY AND MEETING WITH D. CROWLEY AND C. HEALY RE: SAME	1.20	300.00
7/9/2014	APG	EMAILS AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. CROWLEY RE: MEG GRAY STATE OPTION AGREEMENT AND PLANS TO COUNTEROFFER	0.30	75.00
7/9/2014	CRH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW OPTION AGREEMENT FOR CLIENT DAVID CROWLEY AND GREY STATE, CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTORNEY WITH COMMENTS AND FORMAL OPTION PURCHASE AGREEMENT FOR REVIEW.	0.70	105.00
7/10/2014	APG	REVIEW, ANALYZE AND PROPOSED EDITS RE: MEG OPTION AGREEMENT TO PLAN AND PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH D. CROWLEY AND C. HEALEY RE: SAME; PLAN AND PREPARE REVISIONS AND PROPOSED EDITS TO MEG OPTION AGREEMENT.	0.60	150.00
7/10/2014	APG	MEETING WITH D. CROWLEY AND C. HEALEY RE: MEG OPTION AGREEMENT TO PLAN AND PREPARE COUNTER-OFFER AND PROPOSED EDITS RE: SAME.	1.70	425.00
7/10/2014	CRH	CLIENT CONFERENCE WITH DAVID CROWLEY TO REVIEW CHAIN OF TITLE/RIGHTS CLEARANCE AND DEAL POINTS FOR OPTION PURCHASE AGREEMENT FOR GRAY STATE PROJECT, PREPARE NOTES FOR DISCUSSION WITH ATTORNEY AND DRAFTING AGREEMENT.	1.50	225.00
7/11/2014	CRH	RESEARCH AND DRAFT CERTIFICATE OF EMPLOYMENT AND RELEASE FOR CLIENT'S CONTRIBUTORS TO GRAY STATE PROJECT, FORWARD TO ADAM GISLASON FOR REVIEW AND TRANSMITTAL TO CLIENT.	1.20	180.00
7/15/2014	CRH	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PRODUCERS, MIKE BOSIO AND MICHAEL O'DONNELL REGARDING DEAL POINTS FOR OPTION PURCHASE AGREEMENT AND FUNDING FOR DEVELOPMENT OF SCREENPLAY AND PRODUCTION OF FILM.	0.70	105.00

INVOICE DETAIL



Gray State LLC
 David Crowley
 Invoice Number: 171088
 Invoice Date: July 31, 2014
 Matter Number: 41782
 Matter Description: Gray State LLC - General Representation

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	Amount
7/18/2014	APG	DRAFT GRAY STATE/MEG DEAL MEMORANDUM.	0.80	200.00
7/21/2014	APG	EMAILS WITH D. CROWLEY AND MEG RE: COMMUNICATIONS WITH MEG RE: GRAY STATE OPTION AGREEMENT.	0.10	25.00
7/23/2014	APG	REVIEW AND REVISE MEG OPTION AGREEMENT.	1.80	450.00
7/23/2014	APG	DRAFT AND REVISE GRAY STATE/MEG DEAL MEMORANDUM	1.70	425.00
7/24/2014	APG	REVISE AND EDIT GRAY STATE/MEG DEAL MEMORANDUM; CONFERENCE AND EMAILS WITH C. HEALEY RE: SAME.	1.20	300.00
7/24/2014	CRH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW DEAL MEMORANDUM, REDLINE REVISIONS AND FORWARD TO ATTORNEY FOR REVIEW AND TRANSMITTAL TO CLIENT.	1.00	150.00
7/25/2014	APG	REVISE AND FINALIZE DRAFT GRAY STATE/MEG DEAL MEMORANDUM; EMAILS WITH D. CROWLEY RE: SAME.	1.50	375.00
7/25/2014	APG	TELECONFERENCE WITH D. CROWLEY RE: FINAL DRAFT OF GRAY STATE/MEG DEAL MEMORANDUM; EMAILS WITH C. HEALEY RE: SAME.	0.90	225.00
7/25/2014	APG	EMAIL TO MEG RE: FINAL DRAFT OF THE GRAY STATE/MEG DEAL MEMORANDUM	0.20	50.00
7/30/2014	APG	EMAILS WITH D. CROWLEY RE: COMMUNICATIONS WITH MEG RE: GRAY STATE OPTION AGREEMENT.	0.10	25.00
Total Current Legal Services				\$ 3,790.00

Summary of Providers' Time:

ATTY:	NAME:	HOURS:	AMOUNT:
APG	Adam P. Gislason - Associate	12.10 Hours @ 250.00/hr	\$ 3,025.00
CRH	Christie Rothenberg - Paralegal	5.10 Hours @ 150.00/hr	\$ 765.00

Total Current Billing: \$ 3,790.00